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46 XX DSD due to Androgen Excess
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?differences of sex development? DSD
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conditions that are associated with
atypical development of chromosomal
gonadal or anatomical sex Disorders
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'Graphene Based Antibacterial Paper
ACS Nano
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monolayer of tightly packed carbon
atoms that possesses many interesting
properties and has numerous exciting
applications In this work we report the
antibacterial activity of two water
dispersible graphene derivatives
graphene oxide GO and reduced
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graphene based nanomaterials can
effectively inhibit the growth of E coli
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channels are critical for detection of
noxious stimuli in primary sensory
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TRP channels mediate pain
sensations and promote a variety of
neuronal signals that elicit secondary
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gene related peptide CGRP secretion
which are important for physiological
functions throughout the body In this
review'
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