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Management for Software Defined
Data Centers. Riverbed launches
SaaS accelerator and updates SD
WAN products. Riverbed Unveils
Breakthrough Software Defined
Solutions. Riverbed buys Xirrus in
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SD WAN push ARN. Optrics
Partner Riverbed Digital
Performance Solutions. Riverbed
Software Defined Roadshow ?
London Teneo Americas.
Healthcare Software Defined
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Networking Allows Cloud.
Riverbed and VMware Partners
for Software Defined. Riverbed
Acquires German Ocedo
StorageNewsletter. SteelConnect
SD WAN Riverbed Technology s
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Wayne Gretzky. SD WAN
Solutions to Accelerate Your
Digital Journey Riverbed.
Riverbed Technology LinkedIn.
Riverbed SteelConnect SDI 330
WANSolutionWorks com. 25th
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April 2017 Delhi Riverbed.
Software Defined WAN SD WAN
Explained. Data centre priorities
change as Software Defined. App
Defined Networking Part 10
Riverbed US. Riverbed launches
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its SD WAN software defined wide
area. Riverbed Teams With Versa
on SD WAN ? Channelnomics.
Teneo Launches Digital
Experience Monitoring as a
Service. Preference Center
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Riverbed US. Riverbed Unveils
Software Defined WAN Platform.
Riverbed Announces Acquisition
of Leading SD WAN Provider.
Software Defined Edge Part 10
Riverbed US. Riverbed
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Performance Management and
Arista DANZ. Riverbed and
Zscaler First to Deliver Unified
Cloud. Riverbed Unveils
Breakthrough Software Defined
Solutions. Riverbed
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Revolutionizes Networking with
Launch of New. Riverbed
Technology Wikipedia. Riverbed
embraces software defined
networking as a means. Riverbed
? M Tech. Riverbed SD WAN
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Offers Different Options
SDxCentral. Riverbed Debuts an
SD WAN Product SDxCentral.
Riverbed Zscaler first to deliver
unified cloud. Fundamentals of
Cisco Software Defined
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Networking. Riverbed Partner
Locator. CORRECTING and
REPLACING Riverbed Business
Wire. RIVERBED ON
SOFTWARE DEFINED
NETWORKING. Riverbed
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Partner Locator. Riverbed
Unveils Breakthrough Software
Defined Solutions. Riverbed The
Networking Nerd

Riverbed launches SteelConnect
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application defined SD WAN
February 23rd, 2017 - Riverbed
Technology has announced Riverbed
SteelConnect a software defined
wide area network SD WAN solution
that rethinks the conventional
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approach to approach with a cloud
era sensitivities simplifying the
design deployment and management
of enterprise networks Riverbed
SteelConnect is a''Riverbed Opens
Up Software Defined Network
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Development
March 10th, 2013 - Riverbed
Opens Up Software Defined
Network Development with
Flyscript New REST APIs and
Python SDK debut for some
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Riverbed devices in a bid to
enable more customization'

'Riverbed Acquires Xirrus to
Strengthen SD WAN Solution
December 26th, 2019 - ?A
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fundamental rethink to networking
is required and with this acquisition
Riverbed and our partners are
uniquely positioned to provide CIOs
and businesses with a software
defined networking approach that
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delivers unified connectivity and
orchestration across the entire
network ?'

'Riverbed buys software defined
WAN specialist Ocedo
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January 21st, 2016 - Network
performance specialist Riverbed
has acquired German software
defined wide area networking SD
WAN supplier Ocedo for an
undisclosed sum In common with
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most other software defined
applications SD WAN systems
streamline and simplify
deployment and management
processes in this case of''Riverbed
revolutionizes networking in India
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with the
January 12th, 2018 - In a major
move to revolutionize networking in
India Riverbed Technology the
application performance company
today launched Riverbed
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SteelConnect? an SD WAN software
defined wide area network solution
that offers a radically new approach
to networking for the cloud era and
simplifies the design deployment and
management of enterprise'
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'Telstra partners up with
Riverbed for national cloud
December 12th, 2017 - The cloud
networking solution deployed by
Telstra and Riverbed combines the
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vendor?s SteelConnect software
defined wide area networking SD
WAN solution with its WAN
optimisation Riverbed SteelHead
offering in a single appliance'
'Riverbed Software Defined IT
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Survey SlideShare
November 16th, 2019 - Software
Defined wide area networking SD
WAN is getting a lot of attention
these days But just how common is
SD WAN in the enterprise To find

bbq.goodecompany.com                           28 / 133



 
out Riverbed sponsored a survey of
networking professionals at the 2015
VMWorld show in San Francisco ?
We interviewed 260 networking
professionals at VMWorld as they
walked the show floor''Riverbed
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Acquisition Of Ocedo Opens
Enormous Service
January 18th, 2016 - Riverbed
Technology says channel partners
have an enormous opportunity to
drive new services through its
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acquisition of software defined
networking specialist Ocedo By
Mark Haranas January 19 2016 03
29 PM EST Riverbed Technology s
acquisition of software defined
networking specialist Ocedo is'
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'Performance Management for
Software Defined Data Centers
December 20th, 2019 -
PERFORMANCE
MANAGEMENT FOR
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SOFTWARE DEFINED DATA
CENTERS?VMWARE NSX AND
RIVERBED STEELCENTRAL
NETPROFILER VMware NSX
Delivering agility for software
defined networking VMware is
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the leader in the virtualization
market and NSX network
virtualization is a critical
component of the software defined
data center Just as vSphere'

bbq.goodecompany.com                           34 / 133



 
'Riverbed launches SaaS
accelerator and updates SD WAN
products
December 22nd, 2019 - At the
forefront of Riverbed s latest
update is the introduction of
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Riverbed SaaS Accelerator which
aims to improve speed of SaaS
apps up to 10 times other updates
include improvements to its SD
WAN products SteelHead and
SteelConnect Dig Deeper on
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Software defined
networking''Riverbed Unveils
Breakthrough Software Defined
Solutions
September 14th, 2016 -
Riverbed?s new solutions
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announced today include
SteelConnect 2 0 an application
defined SD WAN solution that
delivers enterprise scale
networking for the cloud first
world and integrated visibility
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Riverbed Cloud Ready Branch a
software defined cloud ready
solution that provides a simple
agile and scalable way to deploy
and manage all''Riverbed buys
Xirrus in SD WAN push ARN
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April 20th, 2017 - Riverbed
Technology has acquired Wi Fi
network provider Xirrus in a move
to expand its software defined wide
area network SD WAN and its cloud
networking solutions such as
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SteelConnect Following the merger
the company said its customers and
partners can expect strengthened
unified'
'Optrics Partner Riverbed Digital
Performance Solutions
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December 26th, 2019 - Riverbed
Software Defined Architecture for
Digital Business Riverbed
pioneered WAN optimization
Since then they?ve expanded our
solutions for the software defined
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era They?re at the center of
hybrid networking the cloud SD
WAN SaaS mobile big data and
infrastructure visibility SD WAN
Software Defined WAN Digital
Experience
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Management''Riverbed Software
Defined Roadshow ? London
Teneo Americas
December 13th, 2019 - Join us at the
Riverbed Software Defined
Roadshow on 14th June in London
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to experience the future of
networking and hear from leaders at
Riverbed and IDC Be among the
first to see and experience
Riverbed?s innovative SD WAN
software defined wide area
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networking solutions which are
changing the status quo of
traditional networking
as''Healthcare Software Defined
Networking Allows Cloud
December 22nd, 2019 - Healthcare
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software defined networking uses
virtualization to add much needed
network flexibility so organizations
can utilize and expand cloud
Healthcare Software Defined
Networking Allows Cloud
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Utilization Riverbed announced that
Attune Hearing adopted its SD
WAN solution to give the healthcare
organization a more agile approach
to'
'Riverbed and VMware Partners for
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Software Defined
August 29th, 2012 - Riverbed
Technology announced an extension
of its partnership with VMware with
the introduction of a performance
management solution for software
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defined networks SDN and the
ability to provision wide area
network WAN optimization for
virtual data centers VDC'

'Riverbed Acquires German
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Ocedo StorageNewsletter
November 22nd, 2019 - Riverbed
Technology Inc announced the
acquisition of Germany based
Ocedo GmbH provider of software
defined networking and SD WAN
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software defined wide area network
solutions The acquisition furthers
Riverbed?s strategy to deliver next
generation software defined
networking solutions that provide
application performance and
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business'

'SteelConnect SD WAN Riverbed
Technology s Wayne Gretzky
September 24th, 2016 - Riverbed?s
move is remarkably bold a ?skate to
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where the puck will be? strategy
intended to leapfrog over
networking bellwethers like Cisco
Systems positioning Riverbed as a
thought leader in the burgeoning
?software defined everything? space'
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'SD WAN Solutions to Accelerate
Your Digital Journey Riverbed
October 10th, 2018 - Transform
your WAN into a competitive
advantage with Riverbed Software
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Defined WAN Simplify the way
your WAN is designed deployed and
managed Build a business intent
network with automated Essential
Guide to Cloud Networking with SD
WAN Download Now Analyst
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Report Realize ROI in less than 12
months with Riverbed SD WAN
Read the Report''Riverbed
Technology LinkedIn
December 13th, 2019 - Riverbed
The Digital Performance Company
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is united in our purpose of
Advancing the Human Experience in
the Digital World Behind every
digital experience is a human one
and Riverbed enables organizations
to measure digital experiences and
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maximize digital performance so
they can deliver better''Riverbed
SteelConnect SDI 330
WANSolutionWorks com
December 15th, 2019 - Riverbed ®
SteelConnect ? is the cornerstone of
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Riverbed?s strategy for next
generation application defined
enterprise networking SteelConnect
is a complete SD WAN system for
securely connecting users and
business to the applications they
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need wherever they reside?on a
remote LAN in a data center or in
the cloud''25th April 2017 Delhi
Riverbed
December 1st, 2019 - At the event
you will witness the unveiling of
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Riverbed?s new products with a
new disruptive Software Defined
technology that simplifies
networking for the cloud centric
enterprise combining WAN
optimization with innovative SD
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WAN and Cloud Networking
capabilities'

'Software Defined WAN SD WAN
Explained
December 20th, 2019 - Learn what
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SD WAN is how it works and its
benefits If you were ever curious
about what SD WAN is or how it
works then this explainer video
will teach you the basics See how
it is more effective and efficient
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compared to older technology
managed by Command Line
Interfaces CLI SD WAN offers
greater flexibility control agility'
'Data centre priorities change as
Software Defined
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November 3rd, 2019 - Data centre
priorities change as Software
Defined Networking adoption
rises in enterprise Traditional
approaches to wide area
networking no longer meet the
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needs of business Tags Cloud
VMware Networking hybrid
riverbed software defined
networking software defined
VMworld 2015''App Defined
Networking Part 10 Riverbed US
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November 16th, 2019 - App
Defined Networking Path
Selection What You Need to Get
Started Path selection an exciting
new feature of Riverbed
SteelHead? products will let them
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realize even more gains in speed
efficiency flexibility and
robustness Luckily 2013 App
Defined Networking Software
Defined Edge''Riverbed launches
its SD WAN software defined wide
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area
February 21st, 2017 - Riverbed
Technology today launched
Riverbed SteelConnect an SD WAN
software defined wide area network
solution that offers a radically new
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approach to networking for the
cloud era and simplifies the design
deployment and management of
enterprise networks'
'Riverbed Teams With Versa on
SD WAN ? Channelnomics
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December 22nd, 2019 - Riverbed
Teams With Versa on SD WAN
June 13 2019 Riverbed to offer
Versa?s software defined
networking products alongside its
network optimization and
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management systems
Channelnomics Staff Riverbed is
expanding its software defined wide
area network''Teneo Launches
Digital Experience Monitoring as
a Service
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September 3rd, 2018 - Teneo a
leading integrator of next
generation technology recently
launched Digital Experience
Monitoring as a Service
leveraging Riverbed technology?s
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SD WAN technology Digital
Experience Monitoring as a
Service can help IT teams validate
that end user experience is just as
good if not better''Preference
Center Riverbed US
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December 27th, 2019 - We use
cookies to ensure that we give you
the best experience on our website
More Info''Riverbed Unveils
Software Defined WAN Platform
April 25th, 2016 - Software
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Defined Networking and the
Enterprise As part of an effort to
make it possible for applications
to have more granular control on
wide area network WAN
connections Riverbed Technology
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today unveiled a Riverbed
SteelConnect platform managed
via the cloud that unifies control
of extended networks''Riverbed
Announces Acquisition of Leading
SD WAN Provider
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January 20th, 2016 - SAN
FRANCISCO ? January 19 2015 ?
Riverbed Technology the leader in
application performance
infrastructure today announced the
acquisition of Germany based
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Ocedo a leading provider of
software defined networking and SD
WAN software defined wide area
network solutions''Software
Defined Edge Part 10 Riverbed
US
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November 20th, 2019 - When you
talk to Ray Villeneuve Riverbed?s
GM of Cloud Storage you hear that
easy confidence that only comes
from someone who knows his
product can really help people
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August 13 2011 App Defined
Networking Software Defined Edge
With more than 80 disaster
declarations in the US in 2010'

'Riverbed Performance
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Management and Arista DANZ
December 15th, 2019 - architecture
that aligns with the business needs
of the organization Additional
information about Riverbed
NASDAQ RVBD is ava ilable at
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www riverbed com About Arista
Arista Networks was founded to
deliver software defined cloud
networking solutions for large data
center and computing
environments''Riverbed and Zscaler
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First to Deliver Unified Cloud
October 18th, 2019 - The seamless
integration of Riverbed?s cloud
networking and software defined
wide area networking SD WAN
solution SteelConnect with the
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Zscaler? cloud security platform
enables enterprises to accelerate the
adoption of cloud and incorporate
Internet broadband based transport
in branch and remote office business
locations without'
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'Riverbed Unveils Breakthrough
Software Defined Solutions
September 13th, 2016 - Riverbed
Unveils Breakthrough Software
Defined Solutions Critical to
Accelerating Cloud First and
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Digital Transformation Strategies
Riverbed?s new software defined
and application centric IT
solutions deliver the agility
visibility New revolutionary
application defined SD WAN
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solution to redefine networking in
cloud era'
'Riverbed Revolutionizes
Networking with Launch of New
December 26th, 2019 - Riverbed
Revolutionizes Networking with
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Launch of New Application
Defined SD WAN Solution for a
Cloud Centric World · Riverbed
takes a major step to lead the
explosive SD WAN market with
enterprise adoption expected to
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grow from less than 1 to 30 by the
end of 2019 1 · Riverbed uniquely
enables application defined
networking through'

'Riverbed Technology Wikipedia
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December 3rd, 2019 - OPNET
based in Bethesda MD provided
performance analysis software for
applications and networks which
evolved into Riverbed
SteelCentral On January 19 2016
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Riverbed Technology acquired
Germany based Ocedo a provider
of software defined networking
and SD WAN technology'
'Riverbed embraces software
defined networking as a means
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September 13th, 2016 - Riverbed
Technology Inc sees software
defined solutions as the means to
help its customers accelerate their
digital transformation efforts and
announced a number of product
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updates today at its global
Riverbed Disrupt event on
Monday in New York In an
advance briefing last week with IT
World''Riverbed ? M Tech
December 18th, 2019 - A storied
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company with a long legacy of
market leadership Riverbed
pioneered WAN optimization Since
then we?ve expanded our solutions
for the software defined era We?re
at the center of hybrid networking
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the cloud SD WAN SaaS mobile big
data and infrastructure visibility'

'Riverbed SD WAN Offers
Different Options SDxCentral
September 25th, 2017 - Riverbed
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Technology has long been involved
in WAN optimization As the
software defined wide area
networking SD WAN market has
grown the company has surged into
SD WAN relevance?particularly
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with its acquisitions of Ocedo in
2016 and Xirrus in 2017 Riverbed?s
acquisition of Ocedo brought the'
'Riverbed Debuts an SD WAN
Product SDxCentral
April 26th, 2016 - Riverbed
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Technology today launched a
software defined wide area
networking SD WAN product called
SteelConnect It is the outcome of
the company?s acquisition of Ocedo
in January combined with
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Riverbed?s native SD WAN
capabilities developed over the past
several years But Riverbed
says''Riverbed Zscaler first to
deliver unified cloud
November 21st, 2017 - Riverbed
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Technology today announced a joint
solution with Zscaler a leader in
cloud security to enable
organisations to securely transform
to the cloud The seamless
integration of Riverbed s cloud
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networking and software defined
wide area networking SD WAN
solution SteelConnect with the'

'Fundamentals of Cisco Software
Defined Networking
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December 23rd, 2019 - See how
Cisco ACI combines innovation in
software hardware systems and
ASICs with a first of its kind
extensible application aware
network policy model built around
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open APIs Get the facts and
discover the fundamentals of this
unique new architecture?designed to
accelerate application deployment
from months to minutes?in our latest
on demand episode hosted by
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TechWiseTV s Robb Boyd'

'Riverbed Partner Locator
December 16th, 2019 - 1111 W
Capitol Ave Ste 605 Little Rock
Arkansas 72201 United
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States''CORRECTING and
REPLACING Riverbed Business
Wire
January 18th, 2016 - ?Ocedo is a
compelling and strategic acquisition
for Riverbed Their innovative
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software defined networking
solutions perfectly complement our
own strategic investments in R amp
D expanding our position to
aggressively compete in the
emerging markets for software
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defined networks and SD WAN
bringing disruption to the multi
billion dollar branch'
'RIVERBED ON SOFTWARE
DEFINED NETWORKING
December 16th, 2019 - switches run
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software Riverbed® hardware
appliances run software?so is ?soft
ware defined networking? SDN
nothing more than a marketing
exercise At Riverbed Technology we
see SDN neither as pure hype nor as
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the destination of interest SDN
presents some intriguing
opportunities and is an intermediate
step to a more significant''Riverbed
Partner Locator
December 22nd, 2019 - Av Córdoba
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673 piso 11 Capital Federal Buenos
Aires Ciudad Buenos Aires
C1054AAF Argentina'

'Riverbed Unveils Breakthrough
Software Defined Solutions
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September 14th, 2016 - To address
these challenges Riverbed is
delivering new solutions to help
companies transition from legacy
hardware to a new software defined
and cloud centric approach to
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networking and improve end user
experience allowing enterprises?
digital transformation initiatives to
reach their full potential''Riverbed
The Networking Nerd
December 11th, 2019 - The
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announcement this week that
Riverbed is buying Xirrus was a
huge sign that the user facing edge
of the network is the new
battleground for SDN and SD WAN
adoption Software Defined Wide
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Area Networking SD WAN
Automatic For The People'
'
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Mohammeds Geschichte
Entschleiert Den Islam

Flower Families A Go Fish Game

Corso Di Informatica Per Le Scuole
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Siamo Stati Giovani Insieme

How To Have A Good Day The
Essential Toolkit For
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Bullying Prevention Creating A
Positive School Cl

Die Geheime Sprache Der Baume
Die Wunder Des Wald
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Ceramic Materials Science And
Engineering
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Sudaderas Hombre Con Capucha
2017 Koly Casual Rop
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